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When the editors approached me about writing this essay, I had al-
ready been researching immigrants’ access to medical services for my book
on the history of the right to health care in the United States. Initially, I
expected to show how the Jesica Santillan case fits into that history. It turned
out, however, that Jesica’s story does not actually fit very neatly. First of all, the
Santillan family came to the United States to seek medical care for Jesica;
most undocumented immigrants avoid the health care system as much as
possible, and very few migrate solely for medical reasons. Second, Jesica’s
family had the financial means to purchase her transplant because her
mother had health insurance through her job, and because a private organi-
zation raised thousands of dollars on her behalf. Even though the undocu-
mented are eligible for transplants under United Network for Organ Sharing
(unos) rules, the only public insurance program that covers indigent immi-
grants (Emergency Medicaid) specifically excludes organ transplants, and
most undocumented workers lack private health insurance.∞ Jesica’s case,
therefore, was far from typical.

But there was one crucial way in which the Santillan case did typify the
history of immigration and health care in America, and this was in its ongo-
ing tension between the impulses of exclusion and generosity. Strict immi-
gration laws prevented Jesica from entering the country legally or receiving a
humanitarian parole and forced her family to make the dangerous, expen-
sive, and unlawful journey across the border. National organ transplant rules
then made Jesica eligible for a transplant despite her immigration status, but
Medicaid rules forbid the government from paying for the transplant. The
ins tried to deport the Santillans, but local citizens and even a conservative
senator intervened on the family’s behalf. Duke University, businessman
Mark Mahoney, and the employer of Jesica’s mother were praised for their
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238 beatrix hoffman

generosity when they helped Jesica get her first transplant but were later
castigated by immigration opponents for ‘‘wasting’’ precious medical and
financial resources on a noncitizen.

These seemingly contradictory impulses of sympathy and exclusion have
historically been embodied in the nation’s immigration policy, which has
veered between exclusion, quotas, amnesties, guest worker programs, depor-
tations, raids, employer sanctions, and border crackdowns, and sometimes
several of these at once.≤ It is perhaps not surprising that attitudes toward
health access for the undocumented have reflected the nation’s erratic immi-
gration policies. As I outline below, U.S. policies on immigrant health care
have been fragmentary, contradictory, or nonexistent. Although the general
trend has been to o≈cially exclude undocumented immigrants from every
type of health care except emergency care, this history is punctuated with
examples of great generosity toward individuals. In this way, the Santillan
case is reflective of the history of immigrants and health care in America, and
indeed of the paradoxes of the American health care system itself.

Access to health care in the United States rests on a basis of categorization
and exclusion, of defining who is deserving of and able to receive what ser-
vices based on income, insurance coverage, past health conditions, and myr-
iad other factors, and the nation is notorious for its growing number of
uninsured. At the same time, Americans are proud of the generosity of their
health care system, with its long history of charity and voluntarism. Private
medical philanthropies, individual giving, the coin box on the convenience
store counter raising money for a local child’s leukemia treatment, are just as
integral a part of the American health system as hospitals, the American
Medical Association, and insurance companies. While seemingly paradoxi-
cal, these impulses of exclusion and charity together drive the engine of
American health care, allowing Americans the comforting notion that ‘‘we
don’t let people die in the streets’’ even as universal access to care grows
increasingly elusive. Similarly, the clashing notions of welcome and exclu-
sion in U.S. immigration policies serve to maintain our economic system,
with its cyclical increases and decreases in requirements for immigrant labor
and concurrent demands that this labor be bought as cheaply as possible. The
apparently ba∆ing contradictions of the Santillan case, then, make it not a
historical curiosity but a window onto the complex workings of American
immigration and health care policy.
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health care for undocumented immigrants 239

access and rights to health care before 1986

The history of undocumented immigrants’ access to health care is par-
ticularly elusive for several reasons. By definition, the undocumented leave
few written records. The term ‘‘undocumented’’ itself is a recent one, and
throughout the twentieth century it was often di≈cult to distinguish ‘‘legal’’
from ‘‘illegal’’ immigrants and migrants to the United States. In the South-
west, for example, all residents of Mexican descent were referred to as ‘‘Mexi-
can,’’ including those who had been in the United States for generations.≥

This led to great fluidity in border areas; longtime residents might be treated
like foreigners in their own land, but Mexican migrants could also be treated
like locals. Mutual aid societies, founded throughout the Southwest in the
1870s, intended to serve both immigrants and longtime residents of Mexican
descent, and membership in the societies usually included some health care
provision. In the mining community of Bisbee, Arizona, the company-owned
Copper Queen Hospital treated numerous workers with Spanish surnames;
its records from the 1910s did not distinguish between citizens and non-
citizens.∂ At the same time, when access was restricted, the restrictions ap-
plied to longtime ‘‘legal’’ residents and recent arrivals alike. While some
county and private hospitals in the Southwest and California seem to have
treated both Mexican and Anglo patients, other health facilities were strictly
segregated by national origin. In Los Angeles in the 1920s, for example,
separate public health clinics were established for ‘‘Americans’’ and ‘‘Mex-
icans,’’ the latter ones intended to serve both U.S. citizens and Mexican
nationals.∑

Migrant farmworkers, undocumented or not, historically have endured
the poorest health conditions and the least access to health care of all so-
cioeconomic groups in the United States. However, because of their impor-
tance to the agricultural economy and the fact that they by definition crossed
state boundaries, their health problems have received the attention of the
federal government. The Migrant Health Act of 1962 originated in concerns
about migrants’ supposed propensity to contagious disease. Mexican workers
entering the country to work in the bracero and other contract labor programs
were required to pass through Public Health Service stations at the border,
where they were ‘‘dusted with an insecticide, vaccinated, examined for evi-
dence of venereal disease, given a . . . chest X-ray, and examined for any other
condition which would make the laborer inadmissible or unfit for agricul-
tural work.’’∏ Once workers had passed through the stations, the government
turned over responsibility for their health to employers. Reliance on em-

 EBSCOhost - printed on 4/21/2023 6:03 PM via VANDERBILT UNIVERSITY. All use subject to https://www.ebsco.com/terms-of-use

Celina
Highlight



240 beatrix hoffman

ployer voluntarism predictably proved ine√ective, and by the early 1960s
health conditions among migrant laborers had become a national scandal.

Congressional sponsors of the Migrant Health Act of 1962, which pro-
vided federal grants to local health providers willing to care for migrant
workers, argued that the legislation was intended to protect American cit-
izens from contagious disease, sustain the agricultural labor force, and even
to fight the Cold War. ‘‘[Q]uite apart from humanitarian considerations,’’ the
act would ‘‘help assure in the national interest the continued availability of an
essential labor supply.’’ One New York congressman told a committee hear-
ing that ‘‘the plight of the migrant worker is foreign to our American institu-
tions. This long-festering sore in our society and our economy provides a
propaganda weapon for those who oppose our traditions and ideals.’’ Argu-
ments about national interest and labor demands, rather than the health
needs or rights of the migrants themselves, helped the Migrant Health Act
pass in 1962.π Currently, over 100 migrant health centers receive federal
funding, but advocates estimate that only 10 to 15 percent of migrants ever
use the services. Undocumented workers fearing deportation are reluctant to
attend these clinics, and, due to low literacy levels, many are not even aware
of the clinics’ existence, which are advertised primarily through pamphlet
literature.∫

Sometimes, undocumented workers in need of medical help turned to local
indigent care services. Medical care for the poor in the United States was
traditionally a county responsibility that in the twentieth century became
guaranteed by state statutes. County and municipal health systems were
required to provide care to local indigent residents; the statutes made no
reference to citizenship requirements, and most public hospitals and county
welfare programs did not inquire into immigration status. In general, com-
munities with public hospitals (such as Los Angeles and Chicago) seemed to
o√er greater access than those who relied on private practitioners and institu-
tions to provide indigent care (such as in most rural areas). Local taxpayers
occasionally objected to the use of county funds to pay for immigrants’ health
care. In 1940, an anti-immigrant Mexican American newspaper complained
about ‘‘county charities’’ that ‘‘provide aliens and their families food, clothing,
shelter, and medical care without work.’’ In 1980, a taxpayers’ group sued L.A.
County to ‘‘stop the expenditure of public funds to pay for non-emergency
health care for undocumented persons,’’ but lawyers argued successfully that
the state of California required counties to ‘‘provide health services to all

indigent residents,’’ including the undocumented.Ω

But basing access on local residency was a double-edged sword for mi-
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health care for undocumented immigrants 241

grants and immigrants. Local indigent care facilities had strict requirements
for proving residency, usually demanding not only a local address but also
utility bills, employment verification, and other documents. Such require-
ments likely prevented many undocumented immigrants from ever ap-
proaching the local hospital or health center. In some communities, residen-
tial requirements were ‘‘durational,’’ meaning a patient was required to have
resided in the county for at least six months before becoming eligible for
indigent medical care. In the absence of a citizenship requirement for indi-
gent care, residency requirements provided a legal basis for hospitals and
other county and public health facilities to deny care to recent immigrants, or
to deny reimbursement to providers willing to treat them.

In 1971, a Mexican-born migrant worker launched the first successful
constitutional challenge to residency requirements for medical care. Henry
Evaro, a legal resident of Arizona, traveled to Phoenix to find work as a
welder. He had been there less than a month when he had a severe asthma
attack and went to the emergency room of the private Memorial Hospital.
Evaro was so sick that he needed admission as an inpatient; Memorial called
Maricopa County Hospital and asked them to take him, since he was indi-
gent. The county hospital refused because Evaro had not resided in the
county for at least a year, as required by Arizona State statute. The welder
remained at Memorial for eleven days, and the hospital sued the county to
pay for Evaro’s care. On February 26, 1974, the U.S. Supreme Court ruled in
Memorial Hospital v. Maricopa that durational residency requirements for
medical care were an unconstitutional violation of the equal protection clause
of the Fourteenth Amendment since they ‘‘impinged on the right of inter-
state travel by denying newcomers basic necessities of life.’’∞≠

It was not Memorial, however, but another Arizona case the following year
that would firmly establish a legal right to emergency care for the undocu-
mented. On February 10, 1972, two young children at home in the border town
of Naco, Sonora, Mexico, were severely burned when a stove exploded in their
kitchen. Relatives rushed the children across the border to the nearest hospi-
tal, Phelps Dodge Company’s Copper Queen Hospital in Bisbee, Arizona, but
a nurse refused to even allow them into the emergency room. Instead, she
glanced at the burned children crying in the back seat of the car and told the
driver to take them to the county hospital in Douglas, Arizona, eighteen miles
away. The boy and girl both survived, but their parents sued Copper Queen,
alleging that the hospital’s refusal of care had aggravated the children’s inju-
ries and prolonged their convalescence. When the case reached the Arizona
Supreme Court, the resulting decision, Guerrero v. Copper Queen, stated that
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242 beatrix hoffman

‘‘nonresident aliens’’ could not be excluded from hospitals’ duty to provide
emergency care. The justices based their decision rather narrowly on the
existing Arizona State statute regarding private hospitals’ requirements to
provide emergency care, which did not exclude noncitizens. Until state legisla-
tors chose to make an exception in the case of immigrants, the Guerrero

decision concluded, hospitals would be required to treat all emergency cases.∞∞

The Guerrero decision is still cited today as a major precedent for the federal,
universal right to emergency care in the United States.

The Memorial and Guerrero decisions laid the groundwork for a legal basis
for immigrants’ right to health care. However, they also coincided with a
growing backlash against immigration. In the severe economic downturn of
the 1970s, politicians and some of the public blamed immigrants for taking
American jobs and burdening the welfare state. The 1965 amendments to the
Immigration and Nationality Act drastically reduced the number of Mexicans
eligible for legal residency, forcing many more immigrants to enter illegally;
between 1968 and 1976, the number of annual deportations of undocu-
mented Mexicans increased from 151,000 to 781,000.∞≤ When Congress
added the Supplemental Security Income program to Social Security in 1972,
it explicitly denied coverage to undocumented immigrants. Then, in 1973,
the U.S. secretary of health, education, and welfare issued a regulation deny-
ing Medicaid eligibility to any alien who was not a permanent resident or
‘‘otherwise permanently residing in the United States under color of law.’’∞≥

For the first time, undocumented immigrants were specifically excluded
from Medicaid.

the backlash: irca and welfare reform

The Immigration Reform and Control Act of 1986 (irca) further restricted
immigrants’ access to health care. The law excluded some categories of legal

immigrants from Medicaid during their first five years in the country, and
new sanctions against employers undoubtedly made it harder for the un-
documented to get jobs that might provide health insurance. That same year
Congress amended the federal Medicaid statute to bar aid to undocumented
immigrants for ‘‘any condition short of a medical emergency,’’ thereby creat-
ing the program known as Emergency Medicaid. Emergency Medicaid con-
tinued the nation’s trajectory of setting apart emergency care for special
coverage.∞∂ The program is extremely restrictive, excluding single adults over
eighteen and childless couples under sixty-five, and covers nothing outside of
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acute care in the hospital for sudden-onset conditions.∞∑ As mentioned be-
fore, Emergency Medicaid does not cover organ transplants.

In the early 1990s, some states continued to provide undocumented im-
migrants with nonemergency services such as prenatal care and immuniza-
tions. Politicians sought to remove the supposed ‘‘immigration incentive’’
of such care through measures like California’s Proposition 187, which at-
tempted to bar undocumented immigrants from using nonemergency health
services. The Personal Responsibility and Work Opportunity Reconciliation
Act (prwora), the 1996 ‘‘Welfare Reform’’ passed by a Republican Congress
and signed into law by President Clinton, dramatically cut back on immi-
grants’ (including legal immigrants) access to health care and welfare pro-
grams. prwora declared all state aid to the undocumented illegal unless
states chose to pass new enabling legislation. Some states attempted to con-
tinue o√ering care, but others took the opportunity provided by prwora to
eliminate most health services to the undocumented. In 1996, for example,
California governor Pete Wilson ordered state employees to stop giving pre-
natal care to undocumented women, and in 2003 a Texas district attorney
began a criminal investigation of local hospitals that o√ered such care.∞∏ Both
of these actions were successfully challenged by health care providers and
advocates for immigrants, as was Proposition 187.

State attempts to either end or provide nonemergency care continue to be
mired in legal challenges and confusion, and Emergency Medicaid remains
the only federal health program o≈cially available to undocumented im-
migrants. Uno≈cially, many locally funded health clinics o√er some non-
emergency care for immigrants. At Alivio Medical Center in Chicago, for
example, which provides $1 million a year in uncompensated care, more than
half of the patients are undocumented.∞π School-based clinics are an impor-
tant source of care for children of undocumented parents. This contradictory
and patchwork system of care—o≈cial policies of exclusion and cutbacks
coupled with tolerance of provision at the local level—reflects the nation’s
inability to come to terms with the realities of immigration and the health
needs of undocumented workers.

immigration and health care in north carolina

Until Jesica Santillan’s case, most of the debate and legislative activity
around immigrants’ access to health care took place in areas of the country
with traditionally large Spanish-speaking immigrant and migrant popula-
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tions: the Southwest, California, and New York State. Jesica’s story highlights
one of the major shifts in immigration patterns in the last decade. Fewer
Mexican nationals are heading for the heavily immigrant neighborhoods of
the urban West and Southwest; their destinations increasingly are small,
rural towns in the Midwest and Southeast. In North Carolina, the immigrant
population increased by 72 percent between 2000 and 2004.∞∫ According to a
federal estimate, the state currently has 206,000 undocumented residents.∞Ω

As a heavily agricultural state, North Carolina has long been dependent on
migrant labor, but the composition of the migrant workforce has shifted
dramatically in the past twenty years, from primarily African American to
primarily Mexican.≤≠

Immigrants to North Carolina face extreme di≈culty in obtaining health
care. In 2003, 69 percent of Hispanics in North Carolina whose primary
language was Spanish had no health insurance. In comparison, 32 percent of
English-speaking Hispanics, 19 percent of African Americans, and 13 percent
of whites in North Carolina lacked health coverage.≤∞ Immigrants lack health
insurance primarily because they are concentrated in job sectors that do not
provide health coverage, such as agriculture, and in jobs with wages insu≈-
cient to purchase health insurance or health services.

Although the private Duke Endowment was renowned for its health care
philanthropy in the state, at the time of the Santillans’ arrival the Duke
University Medical Center was not actually the top provider of charity care in
central North Carolina. That distinction went to WakeMed, a community
hospital in Raleigh, and the University of North Carolina hospitals.≤≤ While
Duke was not known primarily for its indigent care or its care for immigrants
or migrants, its transplant capabilities were world famous. It was also one of
the few hospitals in the country providing heart-lung transplants for children.
This is what Jesica and her family had heard about Duke in Mexico.

a right to organ transplants?

At the time of Jesica’s arrival, the unos policy of allowing (or limiting) 5
percent of organs to go to noncitizens had been in place for over a decade.
The 5 percent policy originated in the mid-1980s, when public outrage was
sparked by media coverage of wealthy foreigners, including members of the
Saudi royal family, traveling to the United States to receive transplants. At one
Pittsburgh transplant center, for example, 28 percent of donated kidneys went
to wealthy foreigners between 1984 and 1985.≤≥ unos was urged by some to
ban transplants to noncitizens altogether, but experts argued that immigrants
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were an important source of organ donations (see Eric Meslin’s essay in this
volume for more discussion of this argument, and see Jed Adam Gross’s essay
for more on the Pittsburgh case). The unos guidelines refer only to non-
citizens and do not explicitly mention undocumented immigrants.

Following the Santillan case, letters to newspaper editors nationwide
railed at the unfairness of scarce organs going to someone who had deliber-
ately violated U.S. laws by entering illegally, but others pointed out that
undocumented immigrants actually donate more than the 5 percent of organs
they are entitled to receive.≤∂ ‘‘In North Carolina, Latino families are among
the most likely groups to say yes to donating a family member’s organs,’’
reported the Raleigh News and Observer. ‘‘Latino consent rates ran about 78
percent during the first six months of [2002], compared with 62 percent for
other groups.’’≤∑

Not only do immigrants donate more organs than they are entitled to
receive, they actually end up receiving far fewer than the 5 percent designated
by unos. Only slightly over 1 percent of organs actually to go undocumented
immigrants annually.≤∏ Transplant centers are not required to provide organs
to noncitizens and many refuse to do so. A Raleigh newspaper found at least
two cases of undocumented immigrants who died after being refused trans-
plants at U.S. hospitals.≤π Children’s Memorial Hospital in Chicago under-
went a storm of negative publicity when it refused a liver transplant to eleven-
year-old Ana Esparza in 2001. Ana, who was near death, finally underwent the
transplant at a Florida hospital, and Children’s agreed to pay for her follow-up
care and also o√ered transplants to two other undocumented children.≤∫ As for
Duke, it was far from being a center of transplantation for the undocumented.
According to unos data, ‘‘Of 2,541 people who received transplants at Duke
from Jan. 1, 1988, to Nov. 30, 2002, there were no ‘nonresident aliens’ re-
corded, although eight people did not specify their citizenship status.’’≤Ω The
unos 5 percent marker, then, clearly has not established a guaranteed right to
organ transplants for noncitizens. And Emergency Medicaid’s denial of reim-
bursement to hospitals performing such transplants made immigrants’ ac-
cess to organs even more elusive (this was the reason given by Children’s
Memorial for refusing Ana Esparza’s transplant).

When Jesica Santillan arrived in North Carolina, then, she was ostensibly
eligible for an organ transplant, and Duke did indeed put her on the waiting
list for a heart and lungs. However, Duke wanted to be paid, and as an
undocumented immigrant Jesica had no right to government assistance and
Duke had no right to government reimbursement for her care. But because
of her unique situation as a young female with a devastating illness, Jesica
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was able to tap into two other funding mechanisms for her care: employer
health insurance and private charity. Jesica’s plight led to widespread sympa-
thy for her family among locals in their town of Louisburg, sympathy that
helped Jesica’s mother find a job with health insurance and led businessman
Mack Mahoney to begin aggressive fund-raising on her behalf. Had Jesica
relied only on o≈cial governmental and organ network policies, she would
likely not have received a transplant. Instead, like many Americans (espe-
cially children) who cannot a√ord catastrophic medical expenses, she ended
up relying on the charitable impulses of private citizens.

the politics of charity and sympathy

Jesica’s second transplant and her subsequent death led to extensive dis-
cussions in the media about immigrants’ ‘‘deservingness’’ of organ trans-
plants and of U.S. health care in general. As Leo Chavez shows in his essay in
this book, immigration opponents capitalized on Jesica’s tragedy to demand
further restrictions on immigration and on health services for the undocu-
mented. The Santillan case and its aftermath, however, also elicited extensive
public and media sympathy for Jesica and her family. The Santillan tragedy
led to powerful outpourings of both compassion and anti-immigrant invec-
tive, highlighting Americans’ continuing confusion, unease, and ambiva-
lence about the country’s immigration policies and its health care system.

As Eric Meslin points out, there is widespread acceptance of the ‘‘idea that
charity and humanitarianism are necessary features of the U.S. health care
system that result from inequities generally.’’ The Santillans themselves were
aware of this. Jesica’s family came to the United States not to seek Medicaid
but because they had heard about the Children’s Miracle Network, a private
charity that helped pay for children’s organ transplants at major hospitals,
including Duke.≥≠

It was not this national charitable network, however, that enabled Jesica to
receive a transplant. Rather, the Santillans ended up relying on a particularly
southern tradition of local benevolence. The family settled in Louisburg,
North Carolina, and Jesica was accepted onto the transplant waiting list at
Duke, with the knowledge that a heart-lung transplant would cost around
$500,000, not including follow-up care. When Louisburg home developer
Mack Mahoney read Jesica’s story in the local paper, he decided he had to help.
Mahoney created a private charity, ‘‘Jesica’s Hope Chest,’’ solely to raise money
for the transplant. When traditional fund-raising e√orts fell short, Mahoney
enlisted building suppliers and contractors to donate materials and labor to
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build houses that then would be sold and the proceeds donated to Jesica’s
cause. According to Mahoney, ‘‘Soon, the whole community was involved in
the e√ort. Individuals, local business groups, churches and many civic organi-
zations were working to raise money for the first ‘Jesica’s House.’ ’’≥∞ Mahoney
also helped Jesica’s mother find a job at the local college—a janitorial position
that, amazingly, included health insurance coverage.

Jesica’s case appealed not only to Mahoney and other local supporters but
even to North Carolina senator Jesse Helms, no supporter of immigration,
who ‘‘reportedly interceded on [Jesica’s] family’s behalf when INS o≈cials
considered deporting them.’’≥≤ Such a remarkable outpouring of support
seemed to be the polar opposite of the anti-immigrant reactions to Jesica’s
case that later emerged. This might be understood, then, as a story of Ameri-
can acceptance of immigrants and of Jesica’s right to medical citizenship. But
the public support for Jesica was based not on her immigration status but on
other factors that made it possible for her supporters to ignore or downplay
that status. These factors were Jesica’s youth, her gender, and the severity of
her medical condition (and probably her beauty as well). Mahoney repeatedly
referred to Jesica as a ‘‘little girl,’’ a ‘‘baby girl,’’ and ‘‘my baby.’’ Mahoney
himself had lost a baby years earlier, making these pronouncements about a
seventeen-year-old a bit more understandable.≥≥ Mahoney also seemed to
play the role of the southern patriarch whose benevolence was rooted in
paternalism (a paternalism that emerged quite harshly as a desire to control
Jesica in the Mahoney interview cited by Carolyn Rouse in her essay in this
volume).≥∂

Sympathy for children plays an important role in America’s welfare state
and private charity systems. Government programs are more popular when
they are aimed at children rather than able-bodied adults; such programs as
Head Start and, more recently, the State Children’s Health Insurance Pro-
grams expansion of Medicaid, and children’s charities (particularly medical
charities) are extremely well funded and generate much publicity. And not
only was Jesica a young female whose teenage dreams could be embodied by
a ‘‘Hope Chest’’; she was placed in an even more vulnerable condition by the
nature of her illness, which would shortly kill her if she did not receive the
transplant. As an increasingly familiar member of the local community,
Jesica was an ‘‘identified life’’ of the type discussed in Nancy King’s essay in
this book, a known individual who elicited public sympathy even as the
broader social problems she embodied (immigration, the high cost of health
care, organ shortages) went unaddressed.

Jesica’s age, gender, and medical condition added up to a state of ‘‘inno-
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cence’’ that trumped her illegal status. It is di≈cult to imagine such an
outpouring of public support on behalf of, for example, a forty-five-year-old
undocumented Mexican male farm laborer in need of a liver transplant (espe-
cially if the liver disease were due to excessive drinking). The confluence of
factors in Jesica’s favor made her unusually well positioned to attract charita-
ble support—support that was significant enough (alongside her mother’s
insurance) to convince Duke to go ahead with the transplant.

aftermath: backlash rhetoric versus policy reality

Although her local supporters never wavered, much of the broader public
sympathy for Jesica seemed to evaporate after she received the second trans-
plant, and media coverage became increasingly critical. As Leo Chavez’s essay
details, the Santillan case quickly became a flashpoint for anti-immigrant
sentiment. John A. Mulhall of upstate New York wrote in a newspaper edi-
torial, ‘‘Why were Jesica Santillan and her mother, illegal aliens from Mexico
who knowingly broke our laws, even at Duke University and not in an INS
holding cell?’’≥∑ Feelings against Jesica and her family reflected anxiety not
only about unchecked immigration but also about the scarcity of organs and
high medical costs. Sixty-five-year-old Jackie Mills of Raleigh, North Carolina,
told a reporter, ‘‘I definitely would not want [my organs] to go to an illegal alien.
I don’t think they should be able to come in here and take our hospital and take
our medicine and turn around and sue us.’’≥∏

The image of illegal immigrants using up precious health care resources
came to a head in the aftermath of the Santillan case, but such arguments were
not new. Since the 1970s, hospitals in U.S.-Mexico border areas had claimed
that immigrants were ‘‘swamping’’ emergency rooms and ‘‘flooding’’ local
health facilities, and they used these images to argue for increased federal
funding to hospitals.≥π In 2003, shortly after Jesica’s death, the Bush admin-
istration finally agreed to include $1 billion for uncompensated emergency
care for undocumented immigrants in its Medicare Modernization Act.≥∫

The new legislation infuriated immigration opponents who saw it as a
subsidy for illegal immigrants. California congressman Dana Rohrabacher
introduced a bill requiring hospitals accepting the funds to report undocu-
mented patients to the Department of Homeland Security, which would then
begin deportation proceedings. Rohrabacher used the Santillan case to argue
that immigrants were depleting crucial health care resources that should be
reserved for U.S. citizens. ‘‘We all remember Jesica Santillan, said Rohra-
bacher. ‘‘She was an illegal alien who died after receiving not one, but two,
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heart and lung transplants in North Carolina. . . . There are American citizens
who desperately need organs, and they are being knocked out of line by a
family who broke the law to come here. . . . If we cannot provide medical care
for our senior citizens, we cannot provide them medicines, how is it that we
can provide $1 billion to treat illegal immigrants. . . ? My bill . . . is meant to
deal with this travesty. If passed, it will signal to the leadership that the
American people no longer will stand for this type of providing services for
illegal immigrants.’’≥Ω

Despite strong anti-immigrant sentiment in his home state, Rohrabach-
er’s in the measure in the U.S. House of Representatives was defeated in May
2004 by a vote of 331 to 88. One year later, on May 9, 2005, the Centers for
Medicare and Medicaid Services announced that hospitals would not be re-
quired to ask patients about their immigration status in order to be eligible
for the new federal funds. Instead, reimbursements to hospitals would be
based on statistical estimates of state and local undocumented populations.
For each of the next four years $4.9 million from this fund has been allocated
to North Carolina.∂≠

In this case, at least, anti-immigration rhetoric failed in the face of other
forces: the power of the hospital lobby, which used immigrants’ medical
needs to tap into a new source of funding; pressure from medical practi-
tioners and immigrants’ rights groups, who argued that demanding to know
patients’ immigration status would discourage seriously ill people from seek-
ing care; and finally, acknowledgment of the reality that the population of
undocumented immigrants is large and growing and that ignoring their
health needs is not in the nation’s best interest.

Jesica Santillan’s tragedy both highlighted and obscured central themes in
U.S. immigration and health care. Most significantly, her case reflected the
historical ambivalence and contradictions of U.S. attitudes and policy toward
immigrants. Jesica and her family experienced the clash between generosity
(employer benefits, private charity, a policy allowing immigrants to receive
organ transplants) and exclusion (a dangerous border crossing, threats of
deportation, Medicaid limitations). In the media and in public opinion, Jesica
was portrayed as both a deserving innocent and a callous lawbreaker—the
‘‘angel’’ versus ‘‘thieving immigrant’’ dichotomy analyzed by Susan Morgan
et al. in this volume’s opening essay. Her case represented the continuing
irrationality of the U.S. health care system, in which spectacular technology
and expensive medical miracles flourish alongside the denial of basic health
coverage and services to millions. It is notable that while health care ‘‘ration-
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ing’’ is supposedly anathema to Americans, during the Santillan case ration-
ing was discussed explicitly and openly. The case lay at the intersection of two
areas—organ transplantation and immigrant health access—where shortages
and scarcity are endemic and are explicitly acknowledged. In discussions of
Jesica Santillan, Americans were able to express—sometimes openly, some-
times in more coded terms—their own anxieties about scarcity and rationing
in health care.

In other, significant ways, Jesica’s story was highly untypical and thus
obscures as much as it reveals. It is extremely rare, for example, for undocu-
mented immigrants to get employer health insurance, to have local Anglos
create a charity on their behalf, or to receive an organ transplant. It is also very
rare for Mexicans to enter the United States solely to seek medical care.
Perhaps the most important way that the Santillan case obscures the typical
immigrant experience is that it focused the debate around a highly unrepre-
sentative case of medical immigration (see the cartoon in Leo Chavez’s essay
showing immigrants coming for ‘‘free health care’’). In doing so, it distracted
from the major reasons people come to the United States: poverty in their
home country and unceasing demand for their labor in this country.

These realities were vividly depicted in a news article that appeared shortly
after Jesica’s death. Alfredo Corchado, a reporter for the Dallas Morning News,
traveled to the Santillan’s home village of Arroyo Hondo in Jalisco, Mexico.
Corchado found that Jesica’s was only one of many desperate journeys that
the villagers of Arroyo Hondo had taken over the northern border. Jesica’s
great-uncle, Bernardo Torres, had been a farmworker in the United States in
the 1940s, when the U.S. government created the bracero guest worker pro-
gram to meet a severe shortage of labor in the Southwest. After Torres re-
turned to Mexico, over the next decades he saw more than one of his fellow
villagers depart for the United States, only to come back in co≈ns—‘‘people
who died at the hands of smugglers, fell victim to the heat and brutality of the
deserts or drowned in the Rio Grande.’’ Jesica Santillan was in many ways an
untypical immigrant, but her determination, her desperation, and her sad
end made her not so di√erent from many others who seek work and dignity
in the United States. ‘‘ ‘Sometimes we search for a better life, only to find
death,’ said Torres, 70, as he quietly sobbed. ‘That’s life.’ ’’∂∞
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